
Who Am I? 
"Name: Michael Walters"

"Arrived RVN: January 1969"
"Left RVN: January 1970"

"Company: B"
"Platoon: 1st"
"Squad: 4th" 



VN 25th Infantry Sign.jpg | 25th Infantry 
Sign, not sure where this was.
 (700x700)

VN Alvin Grimes KIA May 13 69.jpg | 
Alvin Grimes KIA May 13 69  My first 
Squad Leader, we were best Friends. I 
shed many tears that day and many 
more since.
 (760x780)

VN Barlow.jpg | Barlow,  from New York
 (700x700)

VN Bunker Monsoon.jpg | Remember 
how muddy it would get during 
monsoon?
 (700x700)

VN Dau Tieng ammo dump Explotion.
jpg | Pulling Berm duty one night and 
some incoming hit the helicoptor ammo 
dump.
 (700x700)

VN Dau Tieng Standdown.jpg | One of 
our Standdowns, they were a welcome 
break.
 (700x700)

VN Dixon Blackie Pineapple Squad 1-2.
jpg | Frazier Dixon, on the left, loved his 
cigars, KIA Dec 3 69. just a few weeks 
before he was to go home.
 (700x700)

VN Don't know names.jpg | Another 
Trac from our Platoon but don't know 
there names.
 (700x700)



VN Dont know who this is.jpg | Not sure 
who this is,  someone in our Platoon.
 (700x700)

VN Flamethrower trac.jpg | Not sure 
where we were when I took this Pic,  
wouldn't want to be on the receiving end.
 (700x700)

VN Frazier Dixon KIA Dec 3 69.jpg | 
Frazier Dixon, loved his cigars, KIA Dec 
3 69. just a few weeks before he was to 
go home

 (700x700)

VN Hardspot Bedroom Suite.jpg | Do 
you remember these Bedroom suites? 
 (700x700)

VN Hardspot Sewer Disposal.jpg | 
Anyone remember having to burn crap?
 (700x700)

VN Hardspot Shower.jpg | Hardspot 
shower, nothing like showering out in the 
open.
 (700x700)

VN Jack Squad Leader1-4.jpg | Jack 
and Grimes were co-squad Leaders 
when I first got to 1-4.
 (700x700)

VN Kit Carson Beanie.jpg | Kit Carson 
Beanie rode on our Trac,  Not sure 
which Trac Cecil rode on.
 (700x700)



VN Larson.jpg | At the Hardspot, his 
name was Larson, can't remember his 
first name.
 (700x700)

VN Leon Beanie.jpg | Leon, our 50 
Gunner our dog to the right and Beanie 
in the back ground.
 (700x700)

VN Letter.jpg | Not sure where I got this 
letter but it was in my album.
 (1700x2200)

VN ME 90MM (weapons squad carried 
one).jpg | 1-4 was the weapons squad 
so we had a 90MM Recoiless, never 
used in battle.
 (700x700)

VN Me again.jpg | Anotherpic of me 
again at a firebase.
 (700x700)

VN ME at the FSBWoods.jpg | Me at 
FSB Woods  (Not sure which one).
 (700x700)

VN Me loading M79.jpg | Me playing with 
the M79.
 (700x700)

VN Me M79.jpg | Me playing with the 
M79.
 (700x700)



VN Me PeeWee he loved the m60.jpg | 
Me and Pee Wee can't remember his 
name, he sure loved the M60.
 (700x700)

VN Me Pineapple Chris Foster.bmp 
(706x725)

VN Me riding 50Cal.jpg | Me riding the 
50 Cal
 (700x700)

VN Medic from OHIO can't remember 
name.jpg | Medic from Ohio, can't 
remember his name.
 (700x700)

VN Medic Pace.jpg | Medic Pace.
 (700x700)

VN MeRiding the 50 and the 
RubberTrees.jpg | Me cruising through 
the rubber trees riding the 50.
 (700x700)

VN Minigun Trac.jpg | One of the Tracs 
in our Company had a minigun mounted 
instead of a 50.
 (700x700)

VN Now there's a bad M-Fer and the 
Cobra is pretty tough too Ha Ha.jpg | 
Now there's a bad M-Fer and a Cobra  
Ha Ha couldn't resist that one.  We 
loved to see them flying overhead. 
Although I did have 2 bad experiences 
with them.
 (700x700)



VN Pineapple WIA, Red our driver KIA, 
Me with shades, Pee Wee.jpg | Not a 
good pic. Pineapple WIA sent home, 
Red our driver KIA can't remember his 
name. Me in the shades and Pee Wee.
 (700x700)

VN Pineapple.jpg | Pineapple he was a 
great guy.
 (700x700)

VN Poem.jpg | Not sure where I got this 
from, but nice poem.
 (1000x1000)

VN Spalding Lynn Kruse Bill Deckard 
three Hoosiers.jpg | Rick Spalding (we 
came in together) Lynn Kruse and Bill 
Deckard, we were all Hoosiers.
 (3688x2608)

VN Speedy Gonzalez.jpg | We called 
him Speedy Gonzalez, not sure which 
squad he was in.
 (700x700)

VN Swimming Pool at Dau Tieng.jpg | 
Dau Tieng Swimming Pool.  I remember 
sneaking in one night when we were in 
the rear area and some a-Hole stole my 
billfold.
 (700x700)

VN Tanks I remember working with 
them for a while.jpg | I remember 
working with some tanks at sometime,  
seemed like for about a month.
 (700x700)


